
 
Council may take formal action on any item appearing on this Agenda.  However, formal action WILL NOT be taken at this 
meeting on any item of business first identified during the course of the meeting as a change to the Agenda, other 
business, or Citizen, Councilmember and Staff Comments. 
 
 

A G E N D A 
 

Delta City Council January 19, 2016 
Regular Meeting 7:00 p.m. 
 

A. Pledge of Allegiance 
 

B. Changes to the Agenda 
 

C. Minutes 
 

D. Citizen Comments 
 

E. Planning Commission Appointment 
 

F. Delta County Economic Development Funding Request 
 

G. Equipment/Vehicle Purchases 
 

H. Renewal of Lease with Ms. Hawkins and Myers for Use of City water on the Grand 
Mesa 
 

I.    Center for Mental Health Community Development Block Grant 
 

J. Ordinance #1, 2016; First and Final Reading 
 

K. Ordinance #2, 2016; First Reading 
Liquor License Approvals 

 
L. City Attorney Comments 

 
M. City Manager Comments 

 
N. Councilmember Comments 

 
 



Item A: 

Pledge of Allegiance 

 

 



Item B: 

Changes to the Agenda 

 



 

Regular Meeting                               Delta City Council                                 January 5, 2016 
  
Mayor Ed Sisson called the meeting to order at 7:00 p.m.  Also present were Councilmembers 
Bill Raley, Robert Jurca, Mary Cooper, and Ray Penick along with City Manager Glen Black and 
City Attorney David McConahaughy.  A meeting notice was posted in the south window at City 
Hall at least twenty-four hours prior to the meeting. 
 
Pledge of Allegiance 
 
The Mayor led everyone present in the Pledge of Allegiance. 
 
Changes to the Agenda 
 
There were none.  
 
Minutes 
 
It was moved by Councilmember Jurca and seconded by Councilmember Penick to approve the 
minutes of December 15, 2015 as submitted by the Clerk.  All in favor, motion carried. 
 
Citizen Comments 
 
There were none. 
 
Public Hearing – Special Events Permit Application; Delta Elks Lodge No. 1235 
 
The Clerk stated that the Delta Elks Lodge No. 1235 has submitted an application for a Special 
Events Liquor License Permit Application for February 13, 2016.  All fees have been paid and 
the application has been submitted.   
 
A motion was made by Councilmember Raley, seconded by Councilmember Penick to approve 
the Special Events Liquor License Permit for Delta Elks Lodge No. 1235 to sell malt, vinous and 
spirituous liquor on February 13, 2016.  All voted yes.  Motion passed.   
 
2016 Designated Posting Place 
 
A motion was made by Councilmember Penick, seconded by Councilmember Jurca to 
designate the South window of City Hall as the official posting place for 2016.  All voted yes.  
Motion passed.  
 
City Manager Contract Approval 
 
City Attorney David McConaughy stated that he requested this contract be put on the agenda 
this evening for approval. 
  
A motion was made by Councilmember Penick, seconded by Councilmember Raley to ratify the 
final employment contract with the new City Manager, David Torgler as presented.  All voted 
yes.  Motion passed.  
 
 



Regular Meeting, Delta City Council, January 5, 2016 (cont.) 

 
Discussion Regarding Administrative Approval of Liquor License Renewals, Transfer of 
Ownership and Special Events Permits 
 
City Manager Glen Black stated that it was requested that staff bring this before Council for 
discussion. 
 
City Clerk Jolene Nelson explained there has been discussion regarding liquor license renewals 
and allowing the City Clerk to administratively approve the renewal when no violations exist.  
Articles 46, 47 and 48 of Title 12 of the Colorado Revised Statutes, grant local licensing 
authorities the ability to approve liquor renewals and transfer of ownership without a hearing.   
 
There also has been discussion regarding special event permits and allowing local approval 
only as well as allowing the City Clerk to approve the application administratively.  Pursuant to 
Articles 46, 47 and 48 of Title 12 of the Colorado Revised Statutes grants local licensing 
authorities the option to assume exclusive local control over and responsibility for the issuance 
of special event permits within their respective jurisdictions.   
 
Allowing for administrative approval will streamline and make more efficient the procedures by 
which the City reviews and approves applications for liquor license renewals and transfer of 
ownership as well as applications for special events permits.  The savings for the applicant on 
special events permits will be $25 per day on the requested permit.  There is no cost savings for 
the applicant on renewals or transfer of ownership.   
 
If Council should consider allowing administrative approval, the following are a few guidelines 
allowing administrative approval: 
 
For liquor license renewals and transfer of ownership: 

 Timely submission of a complete application and the payment of all fees by the 
applicant. 

 Referral of the application by the City Clerk to the police department for review and 
comment. 

 For license transfers, whether the applicant satisfies the eligibility criteria set forth in 
CRS 12-47-307. 

 The Clerk shall not approve an application where the police department has submitted a 
timely written objection to the Clerk concerning such action.   

For special event permits: 

 Timely submission of a complete application and the payment of all fees by the 
applicant. 

 Referral of the application by the City Clerk to the police department for review and 
comment. 

 Timely and proper posting of a conspicuous public notice of the proposed license and 
protest procedures at the location sought to be licensed. 

 Application and applicant satisfies the eligibility criteria set forth in CRS 12-48-102 and 
12-48-103 

 There does not exist facts or information on the application, or as provided in referral 
comments or a protest against the license filed by the affected persons, illustrating 
sound or good cause to deny the application. 

 



Regular Meeting, Delta City Council, January 5, 2016 (cont.) 

 
Discussion Regarding Administrative Approval of Liquor License Renewals, Transfer of 
Ownership and Special Events Permits (cont.) 
 

 The Clerk shall not approve an application where the police department has submitted a 
timely written objection to the Clerk concerning such action.   

 
In the event the City Clerk cannot or will not approve the transfer or renewal of a license, or the 
issuance of a special event permit, then the Clerk shall automatically bring the application 
before the City Council acting as the local liquor licensing authority at the next regularly 
scheduled City Council meeting.    
 
City Attorney David McConaughy stated that another option would be to appoint a Liquor Board 
that would approve liquor applications.   
 
There was consensus to have staff draft an ordinance for the next meeting allowing 
administrative approval.     
 
Discussion Regarding Consent Agendas 
 
Attorney McConaughy stated that on most consent agendas are liquor renewals, minutes and 
renewal of contracts.   
 
Councilmember Penick stated that with the discussion previously, the meetings will not be long 
enough to justify a consent agenda.  He suggested looking at consent agendas in the future 
when the meetings are longer. 
 
City Attorney Comments 
 
Attorney McConaughy commented on a bankruptcy notice he received regarding electrical 
utilities.  He also stated that he will be presenting an update on the Stantec litigation at the first 
meeting in February during executive session. 
 
City Manager Comments 
  
Manager Black stated that the City has received notice of a potential lawsuit involving the Delta 
Police Department.  He also stated that the Center for Mental Health is requesting that the City 
assist in a Colorado Development Block Grant through the Department of Local Affairs.  He will 
bring more information to Council as it becomes available. 
 
Councilmember Comments 
 
Councilmember Cooper commented on the DMEA broadband announcement.    
 
Mayor Sisson commented on the homeless shelter. 
 
The meeting was adjourned at 7:20 p.m. 
              
              Jolene E. Nelson, City Clerk   
 



Item D: 

Citizen Comments 

 

 



MEMO 
 

To:    City Council 
From:  Glen L. Black 
Date:  January 19, 2016 
Subject: Planning Commission Applications 
 

Community Development 
 

Recommendation:  Council Appoint one of the applicants to the Planning Commission. 
 
Background:  Planning Commission has had a vacancy for a number of months.  Staff has 
received two applications for the position.  Council reviewed the applications in a work 
session prior to the regular meeting. 
 
Cost:  No cost to the City. 
 
Alignment With Strategic Planning:  The City Charter under Article IV.I.49 Planning 
Commission states: “There shall be a City Planning Commission consisting of seven 
members appointed by the Council who shall be qualified electors of the City”. 
 
Actions To Be Taken if Approved:  Staff will notify the applicants of Council decision. 
 
 



MEMO 
 

To:    City Council 
From:  Glen L. Black 
Date:  January 19, 2016 
Subject: DCED Donation Request 
 

Community Development 
 

Recommendation:  Council consider DCED request for a sponsorship donation for the 
2016 Western Slope Soil Health Conference. 
 
Background:  Delta County Economic Development (DCED) is again organizing the Soil 
Health Conference and is requesting a donation.  Attached are a flyer and sponsorship 
information. 
 
Cost:  Should Council choose to make a donation, cost will be amount specified.  Council has 
budgeted an additional $25,000 this year for DCED projects or programs. 
 
Alignment With Strategic Planning:  The Comprehensive Plan discusses under Chapter 5 
Economic Development, Policy and Action Items: 

f.  Encourage new agri-business 
g.  Encourage agri-tourism (tours of orchards, farms) 

 
Actions To Be Taken if Approved:  Staff will make donation as directed by Council. 



MEMO 
 

To:  City Council 
From: Rod Myers, Fleet/Facilities Manager 
Date: 01/19/2016 
Subject: Equipment / Vehicle purchases 
 

Fleet / Facility Manager 
 

Recommendation: 
Staff is recommending approval from Council to purchase the equipment listed below. 
1. Refuse Truck 
2. Portable message boards 
3. Boom mounted flail mower 
4. Tri-plex mowers 
 
Background: 
During the 2016 budget process, staff budgeted to replace several pieces of equipment that 
are scheduled for replacement and to add equipment to the Parks and Public Works 
departments. Budgeted for replacement were a refuse truck and two tri-plex mowers. 
Budgeted for addition were two portable message boards to the Public Works department 
and a boom mounted flail mower to the Parks department. 
 
Staff solicited bids from local and regional companies and the results are compiled on the 
attached spreadsheet. Staff has also created a sheet explaining the areas that were out of 
specification which created an unqualified bid. 
 
Cost: 
$245,000.00 was budgeted for the refuse truck. The low qualified bidder was Rush truck 
center (Peterbilt) low bid for the chassis at $134,450.00 and Faris Machinery  (DaDee) for 
the refuse body at $109,992.00 for a total bid of $244,764.74.  The bid did allow for a trade 
in on the old truck for $55,000.00. This brings the total cost of the new truck to 
$189,442.00. 
 
$58,000.00 was budgeted for two tri-plex mowers at the Golf Course. Potesio Brothers 
(John Deere) was the only qualified bid for a total of $50,917.84. 
 
$32,000.00 was budgeted for a portable message board. Safety & Construction (Wanco) 
was the only bid received out of three sent for a total of $18,036.58.  Since bid was much 
lower than budgeted it was decided to purchase two with savings in the fund.  The Public 
Works Department has started to use message boards in multiple locations. Total for two 
sign boards is $36,073.16.   
 



$32,000.00 was budgeted for a boom mounted flail mower.  Western Implement (Tiger) 
was the only bid received out of three sent that provided a qualified bid for a total of 
$15,620.00. 
 
Cost recap   Low Bid  Budget  

Refuse truck  $ 189,442.00  $245,000.00 
Tri-plex mowers  $   50,917.84  $58,000.00 
Message Boards  $   36,073.16  $32,000.00 
Flail mower  $   15,620.00          $32,000.00 

 _________________    
 Total   $ 292,375.74  $367,000.00 
    

Alignment with Strategic Planning: 
By replacing the fleet with newer models, it will lower maintenance/repair cost along with 
providing dependable equipments and vehicles for City staff to use. 
 
Actions to be taken if approved : 
Staff will circulate purchase orders to purchase one new refuse truck, two tri-plex mowers, 
one boom mounted flail mower and two portable message boards. 
 



Equipment type Vendor/ Location Manufactuer Model

Meets 

specs

If no, see 

additional 

sheet

Trade 

in Qty  Cost Each 

Trade - 

in  Total 

 Amount 

budgeted 

Refuse body

Kois Brothers/ commerce 

City , Co Heil Rapid Rail Yes Yes 1 130,410.00$  ##### 81,910.00$     

Refuse body

Elliot Equipment Co / 

Commerce City Co New Way SidewinderNo Yes 1 105,669.00$  ##### 43,669.00$     

Refuse body

Faris Machinery/ Grand 

Junction Co DaDee Scorpion Yes Yes 1 109,992.00$  ##### 54,992.00$     

Truck chassis

Rush truck center/Denver 

Co Peterbilt 320 Yes N/A 1 134,450.00$  N/A 134,450.00$   

Truck chassis Westfall-O'Dell/ Fruita Co Mack LR613 Yes N/A 1 135,917.00$  N/A 135,917.00$   

Truck chassis Bruckner's/ Denver Co Mack LR613 Yes N/A 1 145,979.00$  N/A 145,979.00$   

Refuse Body & Chassis 

total  189,442.00$          

Refuse truck 2016 budget 245,000.00$          245,000.00$     

Message Board

Safety & Construction 

Supply Wanco WVT3(B) Yes N/A 2 18,036.58$    N/A 36,073.16$     32,000.00$       

Swarco No bid No bid

American Signal No bid No bid

Boom Mounted 

Flail mower

US Tractor & Harvest Ferri TD-37 No N/A 1 13,512.69$    N/A 13,512.69$     32,000.00$       

Western Implement tiger RBF-130 Yes N/A 1 15,620.00$    N/A 15,620.00$     

Rifle Equipment No Bid



Tri-plex reel 

mower

LL Johnson Toro GR 3150 Yes N/A 2 27,976.00$    N/A 55,952.00$     

LL Johnson  ( Demos ) Toro gr3150 Yes N/A 2 26,875.00$    N/A 53,750.00$     

C&M Golf & Grounds 

Equipment Jacobsen 62706 no N/A 2 28,889.00$    N/A 57,778.00$     

C&M Golf & Grounds 

Equipment Jacobsen

62306 

Greens 

king No N/A 2 24,999.00$    N/A 49,998.00$     

Potestio Brothers John Deere 2500B Yes N/A 2 25,458.92$    N/A 50,917.84$     58,000.00$       



Non-qualified bid reasons: 

Refuse Body  

Elliot equipment (New Way) 

Item # 8:  The body specifications stated that the loading apparatus is able to lift a minimum of 1500 lbs.  Elliot 
equipment (New Way) side loader maximum lift capacity was 1000 lbs. 

Item # 17:  The body specifications stated that a heavy duty removable positive one piece seal of vinyl tube 
gasket or equivalent to be installed the full length of the bottom and at least 14” up each side.  Bolt 
on or bend over tab seal retainer in unacceptable.  Elliot equipment (New Way) tailgate seal is a bolt 
on design.  

Kois Brothers (Heil) 

Item # 6:  The body specifications stated the hopper cover was to be operated hydraulically or electrically with 
lift interlock and an indicator light in the cab or equivalent.  Kois Brothers bid a manually operated 
hopper cover. 

Boom mounted flail mower 

 The mower bid by US Tractor & Harvest did not meet the following specifications: 

Item # 3 Horizontal reach 13 ft 12’ -2” 

Item  # 5 Down Bank reach 8’-0” 7’-7” 

Item # 7 Max cutting height 14’-0” 12’-9” 

Item # 8 Head rotation 240 degrees 190 degrees 

Item # 10 Hydraulic reservoir capacity 30 gallons 19.5 gallons 

Triplex mowers  

The following makes and models of mowers did not meet the following specifications: 

Make Model Out of spec item Manufacture bid spec 

Jacobsen Greens king IV 
plus 62306 

# 8 engine must be 
liquid cooled 

# 12  Work Lights 

Air-cooled, unclear whether 
lights were included in price. 

Jacobsen GP400 62706 # 8 engine must be 
liquid cooled, Engine 
hp must be 18-22 hp 

# 12 Work lights  

Air-cooled, engine hp 17.7 
hp, unclear whether lights 
were included in price. 

 

Toro GR3150 new & 
demo 

# 8 engine must be 
liquid cooled 

Air -cooled 

 



MEMO 
 

To:    City Council 
From:   Steve Glammeyer, Utilities/Public Works Director 
Date:   January 19, 2016 
Subject:  Renewal of lease with Ms. Hawkins and Myers for use of City  

   water on the Grand Mesa 
 

Utilities/Public Works Department 
 

Recommendation: 
It is recommended that the Council approve the attached 2016 lease agreement with Ms. Hawkins and 

Myers for the use of City water on Grand Mesa. 
 
Background: 
The attached lease is for City owned water on Grand Mesa.  We have historically had a lease agreement 

with Ms. Hawkins and Myers to use water under the City’s decrees for the Maude S. Ditch and other 

City-owned flow decrees from the Doughspoon Creek for purposes of stock water.  In 20012 we set the 

price of the water at $800 and staff feels that price would be appropriate again this year.  The current 

lease expired in December of 2015 and the lessees would like to continue this lease for 2016 under the 

same terms and conditions.  Staff would recommend to Council that the City continue this agreement for 

2016.  A copy of this year’s agreement is attached for your use. 

 
Cost: 
There is no cost to the City. 
 
Alignment With Strategic Planning: 
While we cannot find a clear statement covering City owned raw water and our strategic plan for it, we 

feel we should capture some revenue from the ownership of this resource and this lease allows us to do 

that. 
 
Actions To Be Taken if Approved: 
The City Manager and Ms. Hawkins and Myers will need to sign the agreement for it to be in effect. 



 

 

 WATER LEASE AGREEMENT 

 

 

 This lease is entered into between the City of Delta, 

Colorado (City), and Lydia Hawkins and Varra Sue Myers (Lessee) 

as follows: 

 

1. The City hereby leases to Lessee water available under the 

City’s decree for the Maud S. Ditch and other City-owned 

flow decrees from Doughspoon Creek (hereinafter “Water 

Right”) for the calendar year 2016 for the amount of       

$ 800.00 paid herewith to the City. 

 

2.   The City has previously installed a sufficient tap, with an 

appropriate valve, on the pipeline in the vicinity of its 

crossing of Doughspoon Creek, from which Lessee may draw 

water for the purpose of filling a single stock water tank.  

By granting this right, the City shall be under no 

obligation to maintain any flow of water in the pipeline, 

or to maintain the pipeline in existence, and Lessee may 

utilize such water only at such times as approved by the 

City when water is available and such use will not 

interfere with the City’s use of the water. 

 

3. Lessee shall use such water lawfully in accordance with the 

limitations and requirements of the decree and cooperate 

with the Division Engineer and Water Commissioner in the 

administration of the diversions. 

 

4. The water shall be used in the vicinity of the Doughspoon 

Ranch. 

 

5. The City reserves the right to divert the Maud S. and other 

leased decrees at their alternative points of diversion for 

use of the City through its pipeline or elsewhere when, in 

the opinion of the City, it becomes desirable to do so. 

 

6. The City may sell reservoir water to Lessee or others at a 

market price to be quoted by the City at such time it may 

determine it has available surplus reservoir water not 

needed by the City for other uses in 2016. 

 

7. Lessee agrees to hold harmless, defend and indemnify the 

City on any claim made or adjudged against the City or 

damages incurred arising out of Lessee’s use of the water 

hereunder. 



 

 

 

8. Nothing herein shall convey any title or consumptive use 

right in the Water Rights to Lessee, but merely leases the 

right to use water available under said decree in calendar 

year 2016. 

 

9. Lessee shall not initiate or prosecute any water rights 

application for water from sources from which the City has 

water rights decrees without the City’s written consent. 

 

10. The City is exempt from taxes. In the event any ad valorem 

or other taxes may be assessed on account of this lease, 

Lessee shall pay such taxes. 

 

11.  The City does not represent or warrant the legal or 

physical availability or suitability of the Water Rights 

for the uses desired by Lessee. Lessee shall maintain 

records of its use of the Water Rights, copies of which 

shall be provided to the City upon request. The City 

expressly reserves the right to all historical use and 

credit associated with Lessee’s use of the Water Rights, 

none of which may be claimed by Lessee. Lessee shall 

cooperate with City, State, and/or ditch company personnel 

and all applicable laws, rules and regulations in the 

administration and use of these Water Rights. 

 

12. This lease is dated effective January 20, 2016 regardless 

of the date of execution. 

 

CITY OF DELTA     LESSEE 

 

 

 

 

By       By       

 City Manager     Lydia Hawkins 

 

 

 

 

       By      

        Varra Sue Myers   



MEMO 
 

To:    City Council 
From:  Glen L. Black 
Date:  January 19, 2016 
Subject: Center for Mental Health Request 
 

Community Development 
 

Recommendation:  Council review the request to be a pass through agent for the Center 
for Mental Health CDBG Grant and also consider donating the building permit fees. 
 
Background:  The Center for Mental Health has met with staff to discuss the possibility of 
the City being the pass through agent for a Community Development Block Grant 
Application they are working on.  The City was the pass through agent on a prior grant in 
2008, which renovated part of the building.  The current application would allow 
renovation of the remainder of the building.  They are also requesting Council 
consideration of donating the building permit and plan review fees of approximately 
$5,000. 
 
Cost:  The City will incur staff time in managing and monitoring the Grant.  There is 
potential that the grant amount would trigger an audit of the project in which the City 
would have actual auditor costs of approximately $4,000.  The current proposal appears to 
be below that threshold.  Council would also need to approve a supplemental appropriation 
since this pass through was not budgeted. 
 
Alignment With Strategic Planning:  Not specifically addressed in strategic planning 
documents. 
 
Actions To Be Taken if Approved:  Staff will notify the Center for Mental Health and move 
forward with the Grant Application preparation for the Mayor to sign. 



































MEMO 
 

To:    Mayor and City Council 

From:    Jolene Nelson, City Clerk 

Date:    January 19, 2016 

Subject:   Ordinance #1, 2016; First and Final Reading 

  Election Code 

 

Office of the City Clerk 

 

Recommendation: 

Staff recommends Council consider Ordinance #1, 2016 amending the Delta Municipal Code 

Chapter 2.68.   

 

Background: 

As Council may recall, the legislature has amended the mail ballot election code.  There are 

conflicting statutes regarding write-in candidates and the deadline to cancel a municipal election.  

If the City of Delta only has one candidate for each seat that is available and there is no other 

matter being brought to the voters the City has the ability to cancel the election.  CRS 310-10-

507 states that “in any ordinance adopted by the governing body of the municipality requiring an 

affidavit of intent for write-in candidates …. the governing body may also provide that, if the 

only matter before the voters is the election of persons to office and if, at the close of business on 

the nineteenth day before the election, there are not more candidate than offices to be filled at 

such election, including candidates filing affidavits on intent, the clerk, if instructed by resolution 

of the governing body either before or after such date, shall cancel the election and by resolution 

declare the candidates elected.  If so provided by Ordinance ….” 

 

Staff is presenting this ordinance as an emergency should the City be in able to cancel the 

upcoming election. 

 

Cost: 

There is no cost to the City to amend the code.  The cost savings of cancelling an election would 

be approximately $8,000 to $10,000. 

 

Actions To Be Taken if Approved: 

The Mayor will sign the ordinance and the clerk will publish in accordance with law.   

 



CITY OF DELTA, COLORADO 
ORDINANCE NO. 1, 2016 

 
AN ORDINANCE OF THE DELTA CITY COUNCIL AMENDING CHAPTER 
2.68 OF THE DELTA MUNICIPAL CODE CONCERNING ELECTIONS. 

 
 WHEREAS, the Delta City Charter provides for the elections in the City to be governed 
by applicable Colorado statutes except as otherwise provided by the Charter or ordinance; and  
 
 WHEREAS, Chapter 2.68 of the Delta Municipal Code addresses elections, and 
 
 WHEREAS, the Colorado State Legislature has recently amended Colorado statutes 
regarding elections to cancel an election should there only be one candidate for each seat that is 
available; and 
 
 WHEREAS, the City Council finds and determines that it is in the best interests of the 
citizens of Delta, and would be consistent with the Charter, to add section to Chapter 2.68 
addressing write-in candidate affidavits and potential cancellation of elections to save funds 
where there are not more candidates than offices to be filled.   
 
 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 
OF DELTA, COLORADO: 
 

1. Recitals.  The foregoing recitals are incorporated herein as findings and 
determinations of the City Council. 

 
2. Amendment to Chapter 2.68.  Chapter 2.68 of the Delta Municipal Code is hereby 

amended by  adding Section 2.68.060 and to read as follows: 
 
2.68.060  Write-in Candidate Affidavits 
No write-in vote for any office shall be counted unless an affidavit of intent to be a write-in 
candidate has been filed with the clerk by the person wishing to be a write-in candidate not later 
than sixty-four days before the day of the election.  The affidavit of intent must indicate the 
office to which the affiant desire election and that the affiant is qualified to assume the office if 
elected.   
 
2.68.070 Cancellation of Election 
If the only matter before the voters is the election of persons to office and if, at the close of 
business on the nineteenth day before the election, there are not more candidates than offices to 
be filled at such election, including candidates filing affidavits of intent, the Clerk, if instructed 
by resolution of the City Council either before or after such date, shall cancel the election and by 
resolution declare the candidates elected.  Upon such declaration the candidates shall be deemed 
elected and shall take office at the next regular meeting following the date upon which the 
election would have occurred and as provided by the City Charter.  Notice of cancellation shall 
be published if possible and shall be posted at each polling place and in not less than one other 
public place. 



 
3. The City Council finds that this ordinance is necessary to the immediate preservation  

of the public peace, health and safety, and that a special emergency exists because of possible 
undue and unnecessary expenses resulting from holding an election where there is only one 
candidate for each vacant seat available and due to the necessity to have this ordinance become 
effective before the expiration of deadlines relating to the 2016 regular election of the City.  
Therefore, this ordinance shall be effective immediately upon passage   

 
INTRODUCED on January 19, 2016, at which time copies were available to the Council and to 
those persons in attendance at the meeting, read by title, passed on first and final reading and 
ordered published within 10 days as required by the Charter.  
 

CITY OF DELTA, COLORADO  
 

    By: _____________________________  
Edward C. Sisson, Mayor 

ATTEST: 
 
_____________________________ 
Jolene E. Nelson, CMC, City Clerk 



Ordinance #2, 2016 

 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DELTA, 

COLORADO AMENDING THE CITY’S LIQUOR LICENSING 

REGULATIONS SO AS TO ALLOW THE CITY CLERK TO ISSUE LICENSE 

RENEWALS AND TRANSFERS, SPECIAL EVENT PERMITS, AND 

TEMPORARY PERMITS 

 

 WHEREAS, the City Council desires to streamline and make more efficient the 

procedures by which the City and approves applications for the transfer and/or renewal of liquor 

license; and 

 

 WHEREAS, the City Council also desire to streamline and make more efficient the 

procedures by which the City reviews and approves applications for special event permits and 

temporary permits. 

 

 NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY 

OF DELTA, COLORADO as follows: 

 

1. Recitals.  The foregoing recitals are incorporated herein as findings and 

determinations of the City Council. 

 

2. Amendment  to Chapter 5,10 “Alcoholic Beverage” Chapter 5.10 of the Delta 

Municipal Code is hereby amended by  adding Section 5.10.070 and to read as follows: 

 

5.10.070 Delegation of authority to City Clerk to issue licenses. 

The City Clerk is vested with authority to review and approve applications for liquor license 

renewals and transfers, special event permits and temporary permits pursuant to the following 

criteria: 

A. Renewals and Transfers: 

a. The timely submission of a complete application and the payment of all fees by 

the applicant. 

b. The referral of the application by the City Clerk to the police department and 

other appropriate city departments for review and comment. 

c. For license transfers, whether the applicant satisfies the eligibility criteria set 

forth in CRS 12-47-307 and complies with CRS 12-47-303. 

d. Whether there exist facts or information on the application, or as provided in 

referral comments, illustrating reasonable grounds or good cause to deny the 

application. 

 

B. Special Event Permits 

a. Pursuant to CRS 12-48-107(5)(a) the City Council of the City of Delta, acting as 

the local licensing authority, hereby elects to exercise exclusive local control 

over the issuance of liquor license special event permits for events with the City.  

The preceding recitals are adopted as specific findings of the determination of the 

Council 



b. The timely submission of a complete application and the payment of all fees by 

the applicant. 

c. The referral of the applications by the City Clerk to the police department and 

other appropriate city departments for review and comment. 

d. The timely and property posting of a conspicuous public notice of the proposed 

licensed and protest procedures at the location sought to be licensed. 

e. Whether the application and applicant satisfy the eligibility set forth in CRS 12-

48-102 and 12-48-103. 

f. Whether there exists facts or information on the application, or as provided in 

referral comments or a protest against the license filed by affected person, 

illustrating grounds or good cause to deny the application. 

 

C. Temporary Permits 

a. The timely submission of a complete application and the payment of all fees by 

the applicant. 

b. The timely filing of an application for the transfer of the liquor license 

corresponding to the application for a temporary permit. 

c. Whether the premises subject to the proposed temporary permit is currently 

subject to a valid liquor license. 

 

D. In the event the City Clerk cannot or will not approve a transfer or renewal of a license, 

or issuance of a special event permit or temporary permit, then the Clerk shall 

automatically and promptly schedule for consideration before the City Council acting as 

the local liquor licensing authority.  Additionally, any license or permit applicant 

dissatisfied with a decision of the City Clerk under this section may appear same to the 

City Council by filing a written protest with the City Clerk no less than ten days after the 

date of the decision appealed from.  The City Clerk shall promptly set the appeal for 

hearing for the City Council in accordance with the procedures required by this code and 

Colorado Revised Statutes. 

 

E. The city Clerk shall not approve an application for renewal or transfer of a license, nor 

issue a special event permit, where the police department has timely submitted a written 

objection to the Clerk concerning such action.  Whenever such an objection is received, 

the Clerk shall set the application for hearing before the City Council in accordance with 

the procedures set forth in subsection D above. 

 

F. The City Clerk, for good cause, may waive the forty-five day time requirement for filing 

a license renewal application. 

 

3.  Severability.  Each section of this Ordinance is an independent section and a holding 

of any section or part thereof to be unconstitutional, void or ineffective for any cause shall not be 

deemed to affect the validity or constitutionality of any other section or part thereof. 

 

4. Safety Clause.  The City Council hereby finds, determines, and declares that this 

Ordinance is promulgated pursuant to the City’s home rule authority and under the general police 

power of the City of Delta and that it is promulgated for the protection of health, safety, and 



welfare of the citizens of the City of Delta.  The City Council further determines that this 

Ordinance bears a rational relationship to the legislation proposed herein.   

 

5. Effective Date. This Ordinance shall become effective thirty (30) days after final 

publication as provided in City Charter and C.R.S. section 31-16-105. 

  

 

ADOPTED on first reading and ordered published this     day of     

 , 2016. 

 

 

              

      Mayor 

 

ATTEST: 

 

 

        

City Clerk 

 

 

 

 

ADOPTED on second and final reading and ordered published this     day of   

   , 2016. 

 

 

 

 

              

      Mayor 

 

ATTEST: 

 

 

        

City Clerk 

 



Items: L, M and N 

Attorney Comments 

 

 

City Manager Comments 

 

 

 

Councilmember Comments 
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